
 

PartyCAD’s Secret 

You don’t have to be a draftsman to get 
great results from PartyCAD—the package 
comes with everything you need.  Here, for 
instance, are some of the album pages from 
which you will select pieces of furniture to 
add to your designs.  Over 1500 pieces of 
pre-built  furniture come with the package— 
everything you will need to quickly and easily 
create professional looking presentations. 

You get tables and chairs for all occasions; 
casino and catering equipment; p.a. and a.v. 
equipment; stages, dance floors, pipe and 
drape modules, pavilions, awnings and 
signs; and a collection of lawn furniture that 
includes gazebos, umbrella tables and lattice 
screens. You also get everything you need 
to create building interiors/exteriors and 
landscapes. Finally, you get a large col-
lection of furniture suitable for home and 
office design. Nearly all of the supplied 3D 
furniture was created using the package— 
some of it by people just like you. 

Use the Tent Wizard to create any size 
frame, pole or clearspan tent you may need. 


